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To the User

Dear User,
this manual describes how to use the e-Bidding
on TAG e-Procurement Platform (as Bidder).
Please read carefully the instructions.

The contents of this User Manual are intended only for information
purposes and for private consultation.

This document is property of TAG GmbH.
TAG GmbH shall safeguard its rights taking civil and penal action.
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Technical Requirements

= Hardware requirements:
Personal Computer

= Internet connection requirements
Internet Service Provider for accessing the web-tool via browser. We recommend a high speed connection (ADSL).

= Browser requirements
In order to access, SAP Strongly recommends to use Internet Explorer 11. You can check your Internet Explorer
version selecting ‘Tools’ icon 2! and clicking on "About Internet Explorer”. TAG GmbH can not be held liable for
issues that arise from the use of outdated and/or unsupported internet browsers.
SSL (Secure Socket Layer, protocol for secure transaction) suitability is required. You can check whether you
satisfy this requirement by selecting “Tools” -> “Internet Options” -> “Advanced” from Internet Explorer menu. The
options “Use SSL 2.0” and “Use SSL 3.0” should be flagged.
Cookies enabling is required: select “Tools” -> “Internet Options”-> “Privacy”. For further information please refer to
the Help Section of the browser.
Saving encrypted pages to disk must be allowed.

= Software requirements
An active e-mail address is required so that you can receive e-mail notifications when a document is delivered.
Acrobat Reader is needed for opening pdf files containing documents notifications. Acrobat Reader is available
free of charge at the following address: https://get.adobe.com/reader/.
In order to use all the Service functionalities you need to install the JRE Java Runtime Environment applet. The file
can be downloaded on the Oracle web site at the following address: www.java.com. It is strongly recommended to
update it to the last available version.
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Connect to the TAG e-Procurement Platform

= Connect to the TAG e-Procurement Platform using the following address:

https://b2b.taggmbh.at/sap/bc/bsp/sap/ztag home/home.do

= Go to ‘b2b platform’ and then click on ‘TAG b2b Platform’.

= |Insert User Id and Password.

Trans Austria Gasleitung
@
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Invitation to the Tender To be review: add email screenshot

The user receives an invitation to a Tender
event by e-mail.

The email contains:

= Tender description.
= Submission deadline.
= Link to the ‘TAG e-Procurement Platform’.

Support Contacts.

To connect to the ‘TAG e-Procurement
Platform’ click on ‘Login’.

Trans Austria Gasleitung

TA

user | User |Passwmd| Password Language | English v Logon Change password

@ Trans Austria Gasleitung GmbH
Wiedner Hauptstrasse 120, A-1050 Wien, Phone: +43 (0) 1 59 75 116, tag@taggmbh.at | Disclaimer

BUYER001 <buyer001@cc.ccc>
tome [«

Dear Mr. Tim Brown,
by receiving this e-mail you are invited to participate in the tender event in subject
Tender nr.: 5000000532

Please, make your offer until: 09.02.2016 20:00:00
You can find more information on our website:
Login

Best regards

Trans Austria Gasleitung GmbH

For technical support regarding the electronic Tender, please contact Service Operations Suppaort operated for TAG GmbH:
SERVICE OPERATIONS SUPPORT
Phone number: +43-720 882 855

E-mail: sos@community taggmbh.at
(Mo. - Fr. (Working Days) 8:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. CET)

For further information concerning the Tender please contact: Trans Austria Gasleitung GmbH
Phone number: +43 (1) 59751 16

eMail: auction@taggmbh.at
(Mo. - Th. 8:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. Fr. 8:30 am. - 2:00 p.m. CET)

If you have received this message (e-mail) in error, please inform Trans Austria Gasleitung GmbH immediately forwarding this e-mail
to auction@taggmbh.at. The content of this message (e-mail) and any attachments to this message are only intended for the
designated addressee and are strictly confidential. If you are not the designated addressee, you are neither allowed to utilize, copy or
divulge the infarmation contained in this message (e-mail) or any attachments nor to take any action whatsoever based on the
information contained in this message or any attachments
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Electronic bidding rules and regulations: online
acceptance To be review: add reg. updated screenshot

SAP NetWeaver Busines

To participate at a Tender event, click on ‘Bid
and Bid Invitation’:

= The User has to read and accept online the
‘Electronic Bidding Rules and Regulations’.

= To accept the document:
Select the flag.

Q | Bid and Bid Invitation |

Click on ‘accept’.

I ic bidding rules and ions - TAG GmbH

art.1
Scope

1.1 These rules and regulations govern the electronic bidding procedure (hereinafter “Bidding”) following which the Bidders are invited to submit their Bids.

1.2 The Bidders take part to the Bidding connecting via Internet to the TAG GmbH website auction.taggmbh.at (herein after “the Portal”). They will send their Bids electronically and in accordance with
the following procedures.

Art.2
General Rules

2.1 The Bidder’s acceptance of these rules and regulations allows the Bidder to participate in the Bidding.
2.2 The acceptance of the rules and regulations has additionally to be even given online at any access to the Portal. Non-acceptance will cause the impossibility to gain access.

Art.3
Access Procedures

3.1 The minimum hardware, software and internet requirements needed for the participation in the Bidding are published in the User Manual published on the Portal. The purchase, installation,
configuration and the hardware and software maintenance are in sole charge and under the responsibility of the Bidder.

3.2 The participation in the Bidding requires the Bidder’s registration on the Portal and the identification by a user code (Userld) and operating code (password) each assigned by TAG GmbH and sent to
the Bidder by e-mail.

3.3 To the purpose of registration and allocation of userld and password, the Bidder is asked to provide his own data and any information needed for his correct identification by the “Registration Form”
which is to be sent to TAG GmbH duly filled in. Moreover the Bidder is asked to notify in writing any modification of his own personal data.

3.4 The Bidder gives TAG GmbH the authorization, to carry out in succession the recording of contacts and transactions by telephone or computerized systems occurred during the participation in the
Bidding.

5.13 The acceptance and compliance of these rules and regulations is the prerequisite to participate in the bidding.

Electronic bidding rules and regulations TAG GmbH|
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Tender List 1/2

= After having accepted the ‘Bidding Rules and

|fo and Auction'

Rfx and Auction

Regulations’, click on ‘Rfx and Auction’.

= The application will show the Tenders list.

+ Rfxand Auction Active Queries

errxs MI(3) Published (0) Ended (0
Completed (0

eRFxs - All

»_Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |

Change Query Define New Query Persona

View: ([Slandard View] )| Creale Response | Display Even! Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Exporta a
T EventNumber Event Description Event Type Event Stalus Start Date End Date Response Number Response Stalus Event Version Response Version Q&A | Start Time End fime
D TG116/039 BUYER001 TG116/03 Rix Published 10.10.2016 6000000334 Submitted 2 2 0 00:00:00 09:55:00
|| Tott6m03 BUYER001 TG116/038 Rix Published 10.10.2016 5000000326 Submitted 7 2 0 00:00:00 10:46:00
|| et1600 Tender Rix Published 18.10.2016 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 20:30:00
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Tender List 2/2

Selecting the Tender row, some buttons will be active, depending of the Bid status (Response
Status column)

= Display Tender: click on ‘Display Event’ button or click on Tender number (Event Number
column).

= Display Bid: click on ‘Display Response’ button or click on Bid number (Response Number
column).

= Print Preview: to print and/or save the pdf document which contains information regarding the
Tender.

» Refresh: to update the Tender list.

s Client
<
Rfx and Auction Active uerles

oRFxs AI3) Published (0) Ended (0
Completed (0)

View: [Slandara View] )| Cieate Response || Display Event  Dispiay Response | Print Preview | Refresh I Export 4 &)
Ty Event Number EventType | EventStalus StartDale | End Dale Response Number Response Status Event Version Response Version G8A | StariTime | Endtime
TG116/039 BUYER001 TG116/039 - 0060000112 Rb  Published 10.10.2016 00000334 Submitted 0 00:00:00 09'55:00
BUYER0D1 TG116/036 - 0060000106 Rix Published 10.102016 Submitied 7 2 0 0000.00 104500
16116032 Tender Rix Published 18.10.2016 No Bid Created 0 0000:00 203000

Last Refresh 21.10.2016 11:01:18 C :
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Search

= The user may search the Tenders, to which R e—
he has been invited, using the search criteria.
= Click on ‘Show Quick Criteria Maintenance’ ) —
and use one or more of the following filters: /e [cosiin e [owion_ [owinae et [resmsntime [ meees e
Event Number: number of the Tender S — _—
(RfX).
Event Status: Current RFx, Ended RFx,
Completed RFx.
Creation Date: Tender creation date. Active Queries
Deadline Date Flag: deadline for the T E—
submission of your Bid (Today, Next 7 e
DayS, etC.). (= Hide Quick Ciiteria Maintenance |
Status: Bid status (Saved, Bid submitted,
. Event Number. & | J To | ] =
Bid Returned, etc.). Eventstaus [ <]
Response Timeframe: Today, etc. Deadfnfas:lzi:? '>:77”-| e
Status: =)
= To execute the search, click on ‘Apply’ "‘e: R
button.
= To delete filters inserted, click on ‘Clear’
button.
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Display Tender 1/3

In the ‘RFX Information’ tab, on the ‘RFx Parameters’ section there are general information
regarding the Tender:

= Start Date: it defines when it is possible to create a Bid.
= Submission Deadline: after this date and time it will be not possible to submit a Bid.

= Opening Date: the Buyer can open and evaluate the Bids only at the date and time defined in
the Tender.

= Basic Data section: dates for Technical Alignment phase.
Note: time zone is Central European Time (CET).

Display RFx: TG116/032
| [%] | [Close ][ Do Not Participate |[ Tentative [ Create Response |

Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Published Start Date End Date 18102016 17:30:00 CET Remaining Time 0 Days 00:54:00 ‘Owner BUYERD01

RFX Information | | items | Notes and

RFx Parameters ~ Questions ~ Note and Attachments

Start Date: 00:00:00
* Submission Deadline: | 18.10.2016 17:30:00
Opening Date: |18.10.2016 17:31:.00

End of Binding Period.

Round: |00

‘w Partners and Delivery Information
Details || Add Send E-Mail || Call || Cleal

Function Name

BUYER001

12 27.10.2016 User Manual - Bidder @

= Requester




Display Tender 2/3

= On the ‘ltems’ tab, the User can find all information regarding the Tender items.

= To have the item details, select the row and then click on ‘Details’ button.

Display RFx: TG116/032

| )| Do Not Pariicipate |[ Tentafive | Create Response

Number TG116/032

Name Tender

Status Published Start Date End Date 18.10.2016 17.30.00 CET

Remaining Time 0 Days 00:45:20 ‘Owner BUYERO001

1
" RFX Information EI Notes and Attachments ‘

[ oz s tine - A s 22 o Copy e -] o)

Expand All Collapse All Filter Setiings Hide Outi

@Unﬁ Number ‘ Item Type ‘ Product ID ‘ Description | Lot | Allow RFx, Response Modification | Product Category Revision Level Quantity Unit | Currency ‘ Delivery Date ‘ Notes | Aftachments | Total Value | Internal Item Number
| ‘ + &1 0001E) Material UAT Tender m] O GG0205 10 M 01.012017 0 0 10
- & 0002 Material 906518 Turbinenreininer TURBO-K 20 | Kanister = | [] [m] GGO101 s0L 01012017 1 0 20
D ~ [10003E Outline UAT Tender service item (] [m] 0,000 Multiple 0 0 22
D » @BO0003AAE]  Service servizio 1 [m] (m] 352701 100 H 01.01.2017 [} 0 23
| | - gpoosesm senice service 2 ] [m] ss2701 50D 01.01.2017 0 0 24
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Display Tender 3/3

= On the ‘Notes and Attachments’ tab there are 3 sections:
= ‘Notes’ and ‘Attachments’: inserted by the Buyer regarding economical details.

= ‘Collaboration’: there is the ‘c-Folder’ application link. Clicking on the link, the system
opens the c-Folder application.

Display RFx: TG116/032
[Print Preview | | (%] | [ Close J[ Do Not Participate |( Tentative || Create Response |

Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Published Start Date End Date 18.10.2016 17:30:00 CET Remaining Time 0 Days 00:42.21 Owner BUYERO01

Rexinomaton | ems | Notes ana Atachments |

| Assigned To | Gategory Text Preview
|Document .. Tendering text UAT Tender
- |temozTur | iem text Turbinenreiniger "TURBO-Kin 20 L Kanister
[ Add A |[ Edit Description || Versioning - || Delete || Create Qualification Profile |
| Assigned To | category | Description File Name Versi
Document Header Standard Attachment Contract Draft Contract tet 1
Collaboration

 Cotaburaon exTorisnzz |
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Display Tender: c-Folder 1/3

= ‘c-Folder’ application is used to manage Technical Bids and all technical documents.

= On the ‘Tech. Request for Quotation’ folder there are all technical documents loaded by the
buyer for technical bid request.

Home Refresh Search Favorites Help Logout

2lacE i
| | | | Folder Tech. Request for Quotation Help
Ww Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11... > Public Area > Bidding documents > Tech. Request for Quot...
& Public Area| V|
- Folder
7 Bidding docyments
@ Tech. Request for Quotation To sawe any changes made, click Savs.
L Tech. Public Updates
Name | Tech. Request for Quotal
Subscribe I:l
Authorization | Read |
Hotifications| [ Addifional Functions 4] [Cancel|
Choose an cbject te display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the reguired objects and then choose Copy.
Folder Contents D
NameA Current Version Read | Status
I —— N —
I:l m’rechnicﬂ Request Technical uest for Quotation xt (1 BUYERDD1 18.10.2016 14:49:07
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Display Tender: c-Folder 2/3

= Click on ‘Tech. Request for Quotation’ link.

= Click on the document link. The application opens a popup where it is possible to print and/or
save the document.

Home
Zlelad| Folder Tech. Request for Quotation Help

Current Path: Collaborafion RFx TG11... > Public Area > Bidding documents > Tech. Request for Quot...

EBcotaboration RFx To116032
. Folder

& pupiic Areal v
<) Bidiog document=

To save any changes made, ciick Save.

Name. Tech. Request for Quotar
Subscribe D
Authorization [Read |

oiona Finciors 1
Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Cagy.

Folder Contents [Copy] [Copy as Bookmar] [Au] [None]
i Cl

NameZ
| Elrechnical Request

for Qi ion.txt (38 bytes) from test-b2b.taggmbh.at?
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Display Tender: c-Folder 3/3

= To close the c-Folder application, click on ‘Logout’ button.

Home Refresh Search Favoriles Help  Logout |

e _
| |@|ﬁ | Folder Tech. Request for Quotation B3
Bfcoaboration RFx TG116/032 Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11... > Public Area > Bidding documents > Tech. Request for Quot...
& public Area| V|
0] Bidging documents Folder
@ Tech. Request for Qu . To save any changes made, click Save.
D Tech. Public Updates
Name Tech. Request for Quota
Subscribe |
Authorization Read
Hotifications || Additional Functions 4] [Cancel|

Choose an cbject to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.

Folder Contents [Copy| [Copy as Bookmark] [Al] [Mone]
Name/ Current Version Read |Status |Changed by ‘Changed on
O @Techninﬂ Request Technical uest for Guotation.txt (1 BUYERDD1 18.10.2016 14:49:07

17 27.10.2016 User Manual - Bidder @-



Display Tender: Actions

= After to have evaluate the Tender, the user can:

= ‘Thanks Functionality’: in case he is not interested to participate at the Tender, but he
wants to communicate the reason to the Buyer. It is not mandatory.

= ‘Create a Response’: in case he wants to create a ‘Bid’.

Display RFx: T6116/032
[ Print Preview | | | [ Close || Do Not Participate ]iTmta‘liue i[ Create Ra:punse]l
I 1 1

Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Published Start Date End Date 18.10.2016 17:30:00 CET Remaining Time 0 Days 00:42:21 Owner BUYEROO1

" RFXInformation | tems )ﬁ

‘ Assigned To | Category Text Preview
ftem02Tur... Hem text Turbinenreiniger "TURBO-K'in 20 L Kanister

| Add Attachment |[ Edit Description | Versioning . |[ Delete |[ Create Qualification Profile |
| Assigned To | category | Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out
[i] The table does not contain any data

| Colleboration Created on
Collaboration RFx TG116/032 18.10.2016 14:48:13
18 27.10.2016 User Manual - Bidder @



= Clicking on ‘Do Not Participate’ button, the system opens a popup where it is possible to

Thanks Functionality

create a note or load a file:
Create a note: write a note and then click on ‘OK’ button.
Load a file:

= Click o

= Load a file and then click on ‘Upload’ button.

= Click o

n ‘Browse’ button.

n ‘OK’ button.

Display RFx: TG116/032

[ Print Preview | | (%] | [ Close

Do Not Participate |§ Tentative || Create Response |
—

Decline letter

BIEBEEE k)

Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Fublished Start Date End Date 18.10.
RFX Information | Items Notes and Attachments |
w Notes
| Add . || Clear |
Assigned To | Category
| tem02Tur...  tem text
| |
Nl Browse. [Upload]l
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Create Bid 1/2

There are two functionalities to create a Bid:

1. Onthe Tender: click on ‘Create Response’ button.

Display RFx: TG116/032
Print Preview | | (4] | [ Close |[ Do Not Participate ]fmh[t)mate Response |

——
Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Published

Start Date End Date 18.10.2016 20:30:00 CET

Remaining Time 0 Days 00:57:18
Items Motes and Attachments

Owner BUYER0O1

StariDate: [ | Round:
= Submission Deadline:
Opering Date:
End of Binding Period: | |
Currency:

Basic Data

=]

Technical alignment active: []

Technical alignment start date: [ ] Technical alignmentend date: [ ]
Technical alignment start time: [00:00:00 Technical alignment end time: |00:00:00

[ Details |[ Add . |[ Send E-Mail |[ Call |[ Clear ]

| Function

Number
* Requester

Name

BUYERO0O01

20 27.10.2016
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Create Bid 2/2

2. Onthe Tender List:
= Selecting the row, the button ‘Create Response’ will be active.
= To create a Bid, click on ‘Create Response’ button.

<
[ P

eRFxs All{5} Published (1) Ended (0}
Completed (0)

eRFxs - All

[V Show Giick Criteria Wiai ]

View: [Standard View] hd l Create Response I Display Event Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Exports
T | Event Number | Event Description | EventType EventStatis StartDate End Date Response Number Response Status Event Version
J TG116/044 BUYER001 TG116/044 - 0060000135 Rfx Published 2410.2016 No Bid Created 1
:‘ TG116/040 BUYER001 TG116/040 - 0060000128 Rix Published 23.10.2016 6000000340 Submitted 1
:‘ TG116/039 BUYERO001 TG116/039 - 0060000112 Rfx Published 21102016 6000000334 Submitted 3
BUYER001 TG116/038 - 0060000106 Rfx Published 20.10.2016 6000000326 Submitted 7
Tender Rix Published 23.10.2016 No Bid Created 1
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Bid

= ‘Rfx Information’ tab contains the Tender information.

Edit RFx Response: 6000000322
Submit | Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete

Number 6000000322 RFx Number TG116/032 Status Saved Submission Deadline 18.10.2016 20:30:00 CET Opening Date 18.10.2016 20:31:00 CET

Event Parameters Service and Delivery
Currency:
Status and Statistics
Created On: [18.10.2016 19:4020 CET |
Created By: | Mike Binney ]
Last Processed On:  [18.10.2016 19:4020 CET |
Last Processed By: | Mike Binney ]

Details Send E-Mail Call Clear

Function Number Name Valid from

[i] The table does not contain any data
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Economical Bid 1/2

= On the ‘ltems’ tab it is possible to create an offer inserting the price in the ‘Price’ field.

= To see the item details, select the item row and click on ‘Details’ button.

Note:
- The decimal separator has to be inserted as

“n
y =

Edit RFx 322

Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Glose Save Delete

Number 6000000322  RFxNumber TG116032  Status Saved  Submission Deadline 18.10.2016 203000 CET  Opening Date 18.10.201620:31:00 CET  Remaining Time  0Days00.47:.01  RFxOwner BUYER001  Total Value 0,00 EUR
" RFx Information )ﬁf Notes and Altachments | Tracking

I Details lwuu New. | Copy Pasie Delele | Calculate Value Filter Expand All Collapse All Hide Qutine

Line Number ‘ Description | Variant ‘ Item Type ‘ Product ID | Product Category | Product Category Description | Required Quantity | Submitted Quantty | Unit Price ‘ Cumency ‘ Price Per‘ Delivery Date | Total Value RFx/ Response ] RFxrRespmse.| Internal tem N

- EI0001E UAT Tender Material GG0205 Pumps 10 0 M 0,00 [EUR 1 0n01.012017 000 o 0 oo 10

- @oneE Turbinenreiniger... Material 906518 |GG0101 Chemical Products 50 50 L 0.00 EUR 1 0n01.01.2017 000w o U0 20
D ~ [oiE UAT Tender ser. Outline 0,000 0,000 EUR 0,00 o 0 o0 2
[ | - epooaanm sewiziot Service SS2701 Professional ICTServ 100 100 H 0,00 [EUR 1 0n01.01.2017 000 o 0 o0 23
[ | - eoosasm senice2 Service 352701 Professional ICTServ 50 50D 0.00 [EUR 1 0n01.012017 000 o o oo 24

Questions -~ Notes and Attachments |
Total Value

Identification

Currency: |European Euro

= Configurable Item Number: (0001

Required Quantity: [ 10| M Meter

Control Key: Material functional

Submitted Quantity: | 10| M| Meter

Further Properties

ltem Type: Material | Price: 0,00] EUR Per: 1M
Product Category: (660205 Pumps
Product ID: | ) Incoterm Key/Location: [ &) ]
Description: |UAT Tender ) Delivery Date: [01.01.2017 | (000000
ftem Variant Description: Original ltem Delivery Days:

Status and Statistics

Supplier Product Number: |

23
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Economical Bid 2/2

Notes and Attachments tab:

= Notes: it contains notes inserted by the Buyer. It is possible to insert a Bidder’s remarks:
= click on ‘Add’ and then click on ‘Bidder’s Remarks’.

= Attachments: to insert an attachment click on ‘Add Attachment’.

Note: to see the attachments inserted by the buyer go to the ‘Items’ tab or go to ‘Display Tender’(slide
n.14).

Edit RFx Resp 322
Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Close Save Delete
Number 6000000322  RFxNumber TG116/032  Status Saved  Submission Deadline 13.10.201620:30:00 CET  Opening Date 18.10.201620:31:00CET  Remaining Time 0 Days00:3541  RFx Owner BUYER0D1  Total Value
" RFx Information | ftems Tracking
Add 4 Clear
| | Bidders Remarks | op Text Preview
Invitation to the Tender

Document .. REx/Auction Text

D Itlem02"Tur . REx/Auction Text Turbinenreiniger "TURBO-K"in 20 L Kanister

Add Attachment  Jdit Description  Versioning Delete Create Qualification Profile
| | Assigned To Gategory Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB)
(3] The table does not contain any data
Creale
Created on

| | Collaboration Room
|| RExResp 6000000322 M Bidder 1
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Technical Bid 1/8

On the Notes and Attachments tab there is the link for c-Folder
collaboration ‘Bid’ area:

Clicking on the link, the system opens the c-Folder application.
In this phase, there are two area:

= Public Area: it is the area used by the buyer and it contains all
document regarding the technical bid request. It is the same
are described on the slide 15.

= Bidder Area: it is the ‘Bidder Private area’.

2 (g

eﬁﬂdlabomm RFx TG116/032

Home
Slalaal

Folder Tech. Request for Quotation Help

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder
%) Bidding documents
1 Technical Bid

Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11... > Public Area > Bidding documenis > Tech. Request for Quot...

Folder.

To save any changes made, dlick Save.

Name Tech. Request for Quota’
Subscrioe O
Authorization [Read

o e 1
‘Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Gapy.

Folder Gontents [Copy] [Copy as Bookmark] [A] [None]
Names, |Current Version IRead_[Status_[Changed by __|Changed on

E¥rechnical Request Technical Request for

[ Tech. Public Updates
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Technical Bid 2/8

In the ‘Bidder Private area’ there are two
folders:

= Technical Bid.
= Request for Clarification.

Coutxeaten | Collabaration FFx TG11(
Wame | RFiResp 6000000322 M

mm} RFxResp 6000000322 Wr Bidder 1

» ‘Request for Clarification’ folder is used to load documents on the clarification phase.

= During the e-Bidding Process it is possible to ask to the buyer some clarification
loading files in the folder.

Home Refresh Search Favortes Help Logout

2[al

Folder Request for Ciarification Bl

WW Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11... > RFxResp 6000000322 Mr ... > Bidding documents > Request for Clarification

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1 Folder

<] Bidding documents To save any changes made, click Savs.
U Technical Bid
3 Request for Clarification Name Request for Clarification
Subscribe O
Authorization Write

Nofifications| [Addiional Functions 4|[Cancel]

To create folder objects, select Creafe. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delefe.

[Opload PDX Package] Copy s Bookmark
\Read _|statis |chanced by

]
21.10.2016 12:34:20
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Technical Bid 3/8

= To visualize clarifications gave by the buyer:

B[al

= Go to the ‘Public Area’. e
. . . RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder
= Click on ‘“Tech. Public Updates’ link. O it documents

[ Technical Bid
D Request for Clarification

2 Tech. Public Updates

Home Refresh Search Favorites Help Logout
=1 i

| | Folder Tech. Public Updates Help
flcotaboration REx 1116032 Current Path: C on RFx TG41... > Public Area > Bidding documents > Tech. Public Updates

V]

To save any changes made, click Save.

Name Tech. Public Updates
Subscribe E
Authorization Read

Hofifications| [Addifional Functions 4 |[Cancel|

‘Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Cooy.

Folder Gontents [Copy] [Copy 25 Bookmariq
Name:\ Current Version Read | Siatus Cha Changed on
— —————
O %aﬁgm Clarification for Bidders. bt (1KEB) BUYERO01 21.10.2016 15:07:42
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Technical Bid 4/8

» ‘Technical Bid’ folder is used by the bidder to load the Technical Bid document.

Home Refresh Search Favorites Help  Logout
Ya i _

| | Folder Technical Bid Help
e&w’mw Current Path:  Collaboration RFx TG11... > RFxResp 6000000322 Mr ... > Bidding documents > Technical Bid

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1 Folder
2 B -

To save any changes made, click Save.

Request for Clarification Name | Technical Bid |
Subscribe O
Authorization |Write |
[T [Noffications | [Addifional Functions 4] [Cancel]

To create folder objects, select Creafe. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delsfs.

RdegConients [Upload PDX Package] [Create Copy as Bookmark Delete
Name Current Version Read Status Changed Chﬂwed on
—
1| ¥ echnical Quotation Technical Bid. bt (1KB Mike Binney 21.10.2016 17:50:38

28 27.10.2016 User Manual - Bidder @



Technical Bid 5/8

= To load the document on a folder:

= Click on the folder link.

= Click on ‘Create’ button.

= Click on ‘Document’ link.
= Insert the document name.

= Click on ‘Continue’ button.

Home Reffesh  Search Favories Help  Logout

Q‘ ﬁ‘ Folder Request for Clarification Help
(e o comtpan o o e N

que tarification

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1 Folder

Bidding documents o save any changes made, click Save.
1 Techical Bid
st for Clarif MName Request for Clarification

Sucnae o
o [wilg ]

To create folder lect Creste. . select the then choose Copy or Defete.

[Foder Gonters
| hemes. [CurrentVersion [Read
Empty

Fopy] [Copy as Bookmari]

Home Favories  Help Logout
slal Create Object Hep

flootanoration REx To11632 Navigaton:  Folder Oveniew

Cument Path: o1 > > Requestfor Clarfcation > Create Object
RFXResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder

| Bioding documents

=0 Bidding documents -
Technical Bid
S Reauestfo Clarfiation | document can contan any e i aeront versions.
| Request for Clarification
|Anotos for adding a short desciipive text and oan have versions.

Favorites  Help  Logout

Blal

@couavoration REx TG 1161032

Create Document
Navigation: Folder Overview
Current Path:  Collaboration REx TG11... > RExResp 6000000322 Mr . > Bidding docyments > Request for Clarificalion > Create Document

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1
] Bidding doouments

[ Technical Bid Enter the name and a description. Decide whether or not you want to upioad a local ile now or later. Then choose Next.

T3 Request for Clarification

Create Document

Subscribe [

® Upload Local File

Help
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Technical Bid 6/8

= Click on ‘Browse’ button and load a file.

= Click on ‘Save’ button.

H: Favorites Help  Logout
Bla :

| | Create Version

lcotlaboration RFx TG 1161032 A R e e

Current Path:  Gollaboration RFx TG11... ® RFxResp 6000000322 Mr ... > Bidding documents > Request for Clarification > Clarification > Create Version

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1

WQ Bidding documents
[ Technical Bid

3 Request for Clarification T | Rewsa |

To select the required file, choose Browse and then Save.

Hi

Gl &l Folder Request for Clarification Help

WW Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11_ > RFxResp 60000003272 Mr _ > Bidding documents > Request for Clarification

Refresh  Search Favorites Help  Logout

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1 Folder
VD Bidding documents To save any changes made, click Save.
[ Technical Bid
T3 Request for Clarification Name Request for Clarificat
Subscribe D

Authorization Write

To create folder objects, select Create. To copy o delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delete.

Folder Contents
Names |Current Version
e Yerson

E Wciarifcation ‘Mueﬂ Clarification.txt (11<B)
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Technical Bid 7/8

= To delete a document loaded, select it and then click on ‘Delete’ button.

Home Refresh  Search Favortes Help Logout

Glal L e
Folder Request for Clarification

#coiaboration RFx T61161032 Current Path:  Collaboration RFx TG11... > RFxResp 6000000322 Mr ... > Bidding documents > Request for Clarification

RFxResp 6000000322 Mr Bidder 1 Folder
VD Bidding documents To save any changes made, click Save.
] Technical Bid

" Request for Clarification Name: | Request for Clarification |
Subscribe |:|
Authorization | Write |

EEZA [Natifications | [Addifional Functions 4] [Cancel]

To create folder objects, select Creafe. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delsfs.

Falder Contents [Upload PDX Package] [Create] [Copy| [Copy as Bookmark| [Pa=idl [Delete El
Name/s Current Version Read Status Changed by Chan on
O R Request Clarification tid (1KB) Mike Binney 21.10.2016 12:34:20
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Technical Bid 8/8To be review: add emails screenshot

When the bidder insert a document on the folder
‘Request for Clarification’, the system send an
automatically email to the buyer

When the buyer insert a document on the folder
‘Tech. Public Updates’, the system send an
automatically email to the bidder.
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Technical Alignment 1/3

After the Tender is expired, there is the Technical alignment phase.
In this phase, the Technician user evaluates Technical Bid and he may need more details.
On the ‘Bidder Private area’ there are two new folders:

= Request for Updates: it is the used by the Technician and it contains documents regarding the
request for additional technical information.

= Technical Bid Updates: it is used by the bidder to answer to the request of the technician.

Home:

=

Refresh Search Favorites Help Logout

Folder Request for Updates Help
Bicotaboration RFx TG1161044 Current Path: Collaboration RFx TG11... > RFxResp 6000000342 Mr ... > Bidding documents > Request for Updates
I RFxResp 6000000342 Mr Bidder 1 VI Faolder
= Bidding documents To save any changes made, click Save.
£ Technical Bid
Tl Request for Clarficaion Name Request for Updates
Request for Updates Subscribe =i
C] Technical Bid Updates Authorization Read
Nofifications|[Additional Functions 4| [Cancel|
Choose an chiect te display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Capy.
i G [Cop] [Gop o Bookmare] (] Fone]
Current Version Chanﬁ W Chanﬁd on

[rechnical Request st for Updates.txt (1K TECHO1 25.10.2016 11:33:58
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Technical Alignment 2/3

= |tis possible to load documents on ‘Technical Bid Updates’ folder within the dates indicate on

the section Basic Data, on the Tender:

Display RFx: TG116/032
)

Number TG116/032

RFX Information Items

Name Tender

Status Published Start Date

Motes and Attachments

End Date 24.10.2016

RFx Parameters Questions Mote and Attachments

Start Date:
* Submission Deadline: |24.10.2016
Opening Date: |24.10.2016
End of Binding Period:
Currency: |EUR

Basic Data

00:00:00 Round: 00
17:40:00

17:41:00
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Technical Alignment To be review: add emails screenshot

When the Technician insert a document on the
folder ‘Request for Updates’, the system send an
automatically email to the bidder.

When the bidder insert a document on the folder
‘Technical Bid Updates’, the system send an
automatically email the Technician.
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Bid: Actions 1/2

The user can use the following buttons:

Submit: to submit the Bid to the buyer. This action is irreversible.
Check: to verify if there are errors in the Bid.

Save: to save the work made in the Bid and to submit it another time.
Read Only: to have the Bid in display mode.

Close: to close the window.

Delete: to delete the Bid. The button is available only if the Bid has been saved and not
submitted.

Edit RFx Response: 6000000322
Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Close Save Delete

Number 6000000322 RFx Number TG116/032 Status Saved Submission Deadline 18.10.2016 20:30:00 CET Opening Date 18.10.2016 20:31:00 CET REJ

ltems © Motes and Attachments | Tracking
Basic Data Questions Motes and Attachments

Event Parameters Service and Delivery
Currency: | European Euro
Status and Statistics
Created On: | 18.10.2016 19:40:20 CET
Created By: | Mike Binney
Last Processed On: | 18.10.2016 19:54:19 CET
Last Processed By: | Mike Binney
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Bid: Actions 2/2

= Edit: to change the Bid not submitted yet.

= Print Preview: clicking on the button, the system opens a popup where it is possible to open, to
print or to save the pdf document which contains information regarding the Bid.

= Refresh: to update the Bid.

Display RFx Response: 6000000322
# Edit | Print Preview | & | Check Close

RFx Number TG116/032 Status Saved  Submission Deadline 18.10.201620:30.00CET  Opening Date 12.10.201620:31:00 CET  Remaining Time 0 Days 002450  RFxOwner BUYEROD1  Total Value

n liems - Noles and Attachments | Tracking

rvice and Delivery
Status and Statistics
Created On: ET
Created By:
Last Processed Of CET

Name: Valid from Valid fo Phone Number

Do you want to open or save RFx pdf (10,5 KB) from test-b2b. at? Open Save - Cancel
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Bid Submission

= To submit the Bid, click on ‘Submit’ button.

= |f the Bid has been submitted correctly, the system will display the message: ‘RFx response

6000xxxxx submitted’.

Edit RFx 322
Submit || Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete

Number 6000000322 RFx Number TG116/032 Status Saved Submission Deadline 12.10.2016 20:30:00 CET  Opening Date 12.10.201620:31:00 CET  Remaining Time 0 Days 00:10:54  RFx Owner BUYERO01  TotalValue  6.100.000,00 EUR

" Rexinformation“ems | Notes and Atiachments | Tracking

‘ Details  Add New ‘ Copy Paste Delete ‘ Calculate Value Filter Expand All Collapse All Hide Outline
‘ ‘ Line Number ‘ Description | Variant | Item Type ‘ Product ID ‘ Product Category Product Category Description = Required Quantity ~ Submitted Quantity Unit Price | ‘Currency ‘ Price Per ‘ Delivery Date | Total Value RFx/Response | RFx/Response . ‘ Internal Hem N

‘ ‘ - ﬁm 2] UAT Tender Material GG0205 Pumps 10 10M 10.000,00 EUR 1 0n01.012017 100.000,00 o 0 o 0 10

|:| . ﬁﬂ 7] Turbinenreiniger. Material 906518 GGO101 ‘Chemical Products 50 50 L 20.000,00° EUR 1 On01.012017 1.000.000,00 o [1] i 0 20

|:| w (10003 UAT Tender ser... Outline 0,000 0,000 EUR 5.000.000,00 o 0 o 0 22

D . ”(}DDSME senvizio 1 Semvice 882701 Professional ICTServ. 100 100 H 30.000,00 EUR 1 On01.012017 3.000.000,00 0 0 o 0 23

D - ”0003}\35 service 2 Service 552701 Professional ICTServ 50 50D 40.000,00 EUR 1 onntn1017 2 000 600 00 n n I n n zs

Display RFx Response: 600000032
- Print Preview | # | Close

E RFx response 6000000322 submitted I

Number 6000000322 RFx Number TG116/032 Status Submitted

Submission Deadline

|

" RFx Information )«ﬁf Notes and Attachments | Tracking

Details AddMNew . | Copy Paste Delete | Calculate Value

‘ Line Number | Desaription | Variant | Item Type ‘ Product D ‘ Product Categ
] - &oiE UAT Tender Material GG0205
BE . 0002 Turbinenreiniger... Material 906518 GGO101
j UAT Tender ser._. Outline
:| q, 0003 AAE] | senvizio 1 Service 552701
| | - @no003aBE service2 Service $S2701
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Raising 1/2

= The buyer after bids evaluation can re-open the Tender for an Economical Raising.
» The bidder receive an email from the buyer to be informed.

» The buyer return the offer to the bidder: the Bid status change in ‘Returned’.

= On the Tender, the round number is on the ‘Round’ field.

<

A Gt

oRFxs AI(5) Published (1) Ended (0
Completed (0)

eRFxs - All

»_Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |

View: [[Standard View] || © | Display Event Display Response | PrintPreview | Refresh Exporta
| Event Number Event Descripiion Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Stafus
TG116/044 BUYERD01 TG116/044 - 0060000135 Rfic Published 24102016 6000000342 Submitied Display RFx: TG116/032
TG6116/040 BUYER001 TG116/040 - 0060000128 Rbx Fublished 23102016 6000000340 Submitied &)
TG116/039 BUYER001 TG116/039 - 0060000112 Rix Published 21102016 6000000334 Submitied
TG116/038 BUYER001 TG116/038 - 0060000106 Rt Published 20102016 5000000326 Submitted Number TG116/032 Name Tender Status Published Start Date End Date 24102016
16116032 Tender Réx Published 24102016 6000000322 Retumed

RFXlnfmmminll} ltems Notes and Altachments

RFx Parameters = Questions = Note and Attachments

Start Date: 00:00:00 Round: |01

* Submission Deadiine: |24.10. 2016 17-40:00
Opening Date: [24.10.2016 17:41:00
End of Binding Period.
Currency: |[EUR

Basic Data =]

39 27.10.2016 User Manual - Bidder TA



* To open the Bid, click on ‘Response Number’.

Raising 2/2

» The system shows the message: ‘RFx changed; you must modify the RFx response’.
= Clicking on ‘Edit’ button, it is possible to change the Economical Bid and re-submit it.

Display RFx Response: 6000000322
Print Preview | r, | Check Close Parficipate Do Not Parficipate Tentative

RFx changed, you must modify the RFx response I

Number 6000000322 RFx Number TG116/032 Status Returned

RFx Information ltems © MNotes and Attachments ©  Tracking

Submission Deadline 25.10.2016

Basic Data ‘Questions Motes and Attachments:

Event Parameters
Currency: |European Euro

Edit RFx Response: 6000000322
Read Only PnntPreviewl Check Close Save

" Number 6000000322

RFx Number TG116/032

Status Retumed

Hems - Notes and Attachments

Submission Deadline 25.10.2016 12:50:00 CET

‘Opening Date 25.10.2016 12:51.00 CET

Remaining Time

0 Days 00:07.04 RFx

RFx Information
w ltem Overview
Delails AddNew. | Copy Paste Delele | Calculate Value
Line Number Description Variant  Item Type
« G001 UAT Tender Material
« @lo02E Turbinenreiniger. Material
> CjuutiE UAT Tender ser... Qutiine
= @B 0003 AAE]  servizio 1 Service
- @B 0003 ABE] service 2 Service

Product ID  Product Category

906518

Product Category Descripion  Required Quantity = Submitted Quantity Unit

Pumps

Chemical Products

Professional ICTServ

Professional ICTServ

10

50
0,000
100
50

10 M
50 L
0,000
100 H
50D

Price Currency

1.000,00 EUR
2.000,00 EUR

EUR
3.000,00 EUR
4.000,00 EUR
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To close the application:
= Click on the ‘Log Off’ button (right side of the screen).

Log Off

et

eRFxs All(4) Published (1) Ended (0
Completed (0

€RFxs - All

» Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |

e Response | D

View: [[Standard View] ~)| cre

;| Event Number Event Descripion

|:| T1G116/040 BUYER001 TG116/040 - 0060000128
|:| 1G116/039 BUYER001 TG116/038 - 0060000112
D T1G116/038 BUYER001 TG116/038 - 0060000108
|:| T1G116/032 Tender

Display Respons;

Change Query Define New Query Personalize

| PrntPreview | Refresh Exporta &
Event Type Event Stalus Start Date End Date Response Number Respense Slalus Event Version Response Version QaA Start Time End time
Rf Published 23102016 6000000340 Submitted 1 1 0| 00:00:00 13:51:00
Rf Published 21102016 6000000334 Submitted 3 2 0| 00:00:00 16:00:00
Rfx Published 20.10.2016 6000000326 Submitied 7 2 0 00:00:00 10:46.00
Rft Published 24.10.2016 6000000322 Submitted 3 3 0 | 00:00:00 17:50:00

41

27.10.2016

User Manual - Bidder

TA



Support To be updated

For technical assistance please contact
Service Operations Support
Phone no.: +43 (0)720 882 855
sos@community.taggmbh.at
Cc: auction@taggmbh.at
Monday to Friday: 08:30 a.m. - 05:30 p.m. CET
(Austrian Working Days)

For business clarifications please contact:
Trans Austria Gasleitung GmbH
Phone number: +43 1 59751 16

E-mail: auction@taggmbh.at
Monday to Thursday: 08:30 a.m. - 05:30 p.m.;
Friday 08:30 a.m. - 02:00 p.m. CET
(Austrian Working Days)
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Copyrights and Trademarks

SAP, SAP-Logo, mySAP.com, R/3 are registered trademarks of SAP AG.

Microsoft®, WINDOWS®, Excel®, Access®, Word®, PowerPoint®,

Internet Explorer® are registered trademarks of Microsoft Corp.

- Adobe® Reader® and Adobe PDF are registered trademarks of Adobe

Systems Inc.

- Java'™ is a trademark of ORACLE Corp.

- All other products names and company logos mentioned in the web-tools

are trademarks of their respective owners.
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